



Spreadsheet Evaluation - RFQ #2868  
Miscellaneous Electric Material

Item #	Qty	Description	One Source	Anixter, Inc.	California Electric	Wesco Distribution
1	200	115-8607 Pin, 3/4" x 7", Steel Galvanized, Joslyn #J607Z	\$2,536.00	\$2,300.00	No Bid	\$2,470.00
2	60	115-9073 Guy Guard, Plastic, 8', Yellow, Pre- formed #PG5718	\$279.75 (for 75 - \$3.73/ea)	\$199.20 (for 60 - \$3.32/ea)	\$511.20 (for 60 - \$8.52/ea)	\$891.75 (for 75 - \$11.89/ea)
3	250	117-0055 Bolt, Carriage, 3/8" x 4-1/2", Hot Dipped Galvanized, Joslyn #J8634-1/2	\$162.50	\$142.50	No Bid	\$108.75
4	200	117-0114 Bolt, Machine, 5/8" x 14", Hot Dipped Galvanized, MCED #DF3814, Chance #8814, Joslyn #J8814 WITH NUT	\$246.00	\$236.00	No Bid	\$234.00
5	300	117-0885 Washer, Tapped Lip, 2" w/ 3/4" Hole, for use with x-arm pins 12 kV or higher, Hughes #LW70T-No Subs!	\$357.00	\$366.00	No Bid	\$476.40
6	150	117-0906 Washer, Sq. Curved, 3" x 3" x 3/4" Hole, Galvanized, MCED #DF4W5, Joslyn #J6823	\$139.50	\$117.00	No Bid	\$92.10
7	150	117-0920 Nut, Oval Eye, 5/8", Galvanized, MCED #DG2E3, Joslyn/Chance #J1092/ 6502, Continental #EN-5	\$256.50	\$241.50	No Bid	\$192.75
8	300	117-1130 Deadend Service Grip, #4 Aluminum, Helical #HSG514, Preformed #SG4502	\$187.20	\$174.00	No Bid	\$168.00
9	100	117-1137 Deadend Service Grip, 1/0 ACSR, Helical #HSG522, Preformed #SG4506	\$109.50	\$127.00	No Bid	\$118.00
10	100	117-1350 Service Knobe Nylon Wire, Joslyn #J0588-Z or MCED #DW2C5	\$499.00	\$507.00	No Bid	\$490.00
11	100	117-1507 Connector, Insulink, 2-4 Str, P.U. #PIK-12 or Burndy #ES2R2W	\$37.00	\$45.00	\$70.00	\$38.80
12	250	117-1508 Connector, Insulink, 4-4 Str., P.U. #PIK-22	\$111.00 (for 300 - .37/ea)	\$112.50 (for 250 - \$.45/ea)	\$80.50 (for 250 - \$.46/ea)	\$116.14 (for 300 - \$.388/ea)
13	30	117-2011 Tape, Coding, 3/4" x 66', Blue, Scotch 3-M, #35 - No Subs!	\$105.00	\$125.30	\$105.00	\$112.50
14	165	117-1599 Line Tap for CU, Al or ACSR aka Squeeze-on Connectors, Burndy #YHO-100	\$68.25	\$71.75	\$94.50	\$97.48
15	100	117-7001 Adapter, Wire, for PED-350 bus Utilco 3R0222C00A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
16	100	118-0810	\$851.00	\$782.00	No Bid	\$740.00

		Clamp, CU Hot Line Tap, 2/0, #8				
		Solid, Fargo #GH-100 or HPS #BC210				
17	50	118-2009	\$491.50	\$496.50	\$913.00	\$1,596.50
		Sleeve, Tension, 33.4 Aluminum, Burndy #YDS301AT				
18	60	118-5055	\$352.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Insulator Pin, Brown, Ohio Brass #12847, Use on Secondary Overhead	(for 72 - \$4.90/ea)			
19	15	118-9946	\$352.80	\$94.65	No Bid	\$90.00
		Auto Dead End, Clevis Bail, #6-SOL, for CU, Fargo #GD-511 - No Subs! Domestic Only, All-Steel, Fargo #GD-511	(for 50 - \$7.07/ea)	(for 15 - \$6.31/ea)		(for 15 - \$6.00/ea)
20	20	122-2203	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$160.68
		Elbow, 2", 45 Degree, P&C, DB-120, 36"R, Thin Walled Plastic Conduit, Carlou #PH7FJ				
21	72	122-6103	\$334.80	\$372.24	No Bid	\$321.12
		Rust Cutter, 6 Oz Aerosol, Kearney #19229-1 (24 ea/cs)				
22	25	124-6063	\$1,048.50	\$943.00	No Bid	\$1,071.75
		Terminator, Single Piece, 2 Str., 25 kV, for .780 Insulation Diameter, 15 kV Cable, Elastimold #16-THG-FG-0220-4				
23	12	124-6106	\$122.76	\$111.24	No Bid	\$122.70
		Stress Cone, #2 Str., 15 kV Cable, for .780 Insulation Diameter, Elastimold #35MSC-FG				
24	60	124-6320	\$1,380.00	\$1,460.40	No Bid	\$1,347.00
		Elbow, Loadbreak, #2 Str., 15 kV, for .780 Insulation Diameter, 8.3/14.4 kV Class 200 Amp, Elastimold #162LRB5220 - No Subs!				
25	10	124-6803	\$1,684.80	\$1,693.70	No Bid	\$1,610.00
		Tap Plug, Reducing, 15kV, 600-200A, Loadbreak for T-Body Only w/ Stud, for terminating 600 Amp T-Body, Cooper #LRT615				
26	100	124-9601	\$134.00	\$70.00	\$180.00	\$207.30
		Lug, CU Compressed, Terminal, #2 Str., Stud: 3/8", 1-Hole, Burndy #YA2C-L4-BOX - No subs!				
27	50	124-9602	\$271.00	\$273.50	\$171.00	\$371.00
		Lug, CU Compressed, Terminal, #2 CU, 3/8", 2-Hole, Burndy #YA2C- 2NTC38				
28	50	124-9604	\$63.50	\$71.00	\$54.50	\$54.50
		Lug, CU Compressed, Terminal, #4 Str., Stud Size: 3/8", 1-Hole, Burndy #YA4CJ-L4-BOX- No Subs!				
29	40	124-9608	\$132.80	\$132.40	\$136.40	\$336.00
		Lug, CU Compression, 3/0 Str, stud size: 1/2", 1-Hole, Burndy #YA27- No Subs!				
30	25	124-9623	\$255.00	\$208.75	\$281.75	\$267.60
		Lug, CU Comp., Terminal, #500 MCM (Xfmr), Stud: 1/2", 2-Hole, Burndy #YA34-2N- No subs!				
31	10	124-9652	\$237.00	\$226.60	No Bid	\$479.50
		Connector, 4-Cable 4-Hole, #6-350, AL-CU, Homac #AT4A4 - 350N				