



Spreadsheet Evaluation - RFQ #2867
Miscellaneous Water Distribution Parts

Item #	Qty	Description	Corix Water	Famcon Pipe	Core & Main	USA Bluebook	Ferguson Enterprises
1	2	A010935 - Ford Meter Box Tapped Repair Clamp, FS1-1215-15-IP7 (OD Range 11.75-12.15), 10" ACP w/ 2" IP Tap, 15" Long	\$484.00	\$499.00	\$490.00	\$799.30	\$522.00
2	10	A012640-Clamp, Wrap, 1" x 3" Long, w/ full wrap gasket, Ford #FSC-113-3R	\$195.50	\$202.50	\$197.50	\$61.70	\$210.00
3	3	B010815 - Adapter, Megaflange, 4" for all pipe, complete with gasket, bolts & nuts, EBAA Series 2100, P/N 2104E	\$214.47	\$231.00	\$198.00	\$364.35	\$237.00
4	66	C013520 Bolt, Cap Screw Hex Head, 5/8" x 2-1/2", with nut, Tripac Blue 2000 or T-2000 Blue Only	\$156.42	\$125.40	\$171.60	\$236.94	\$99.00
5	25	D010720 Gasket, Granite Ring, 6" Std., Pkg of 25/ea, Nonasbestos Material	\$31.25	\$28.75	\$56.25	\$196.25	\$56.10
6	13	D011420 Primer, PVC/CPVC Pint, Weld-On P70, Purple	\$104.00	\$74.75	\$97.50	\$139.10	\$143.00
7	36	D011570 Tape, Teflon Sealed Thread, 1", #T-27730A	\$33.12	\$36.00	\$23.40	\$82.80	\$54.00
8	6	E020620 Nipple, 3" x 8", TxT, PVC Sch 80	\$25.80	\$93.00	\$90.00	\$100.80	\$30.00
9	10	E020700 Tee, Slip, 3 x 3 x 3", PVC Sch 80, Carlon #801-030	\$110.00	\$120.00	\$130.00	\$121.50	\$130.00
10	10	E020740 Union, FIPT, 3/4", PVC Sch 80, Carlon #858-007	\$38.10	\$46.50	\$45.00	\$34.00	\$55.00
11	40	F011365 Coupling, straight, 3/4" MIPT x 3/4" PJ for PVC, Ford #C87-33 (No subs!)	\$670.80	\$712.00	\$710.00	\$1,082.00	\$760.00
12	12	F011415 Coupling, straight, 1-1/2" FIPT - 1-1/2" PJ for IP, Ford #C15-66 (No subs!)	\$630.60	\$669.00	\$666.00	\$1,016.76	\$699.00
13	8	F011768 Wrench, Adjustable Hydrant, Jones #J-583, 12" Standard	\$176.00	\$152.00	\$584.00	\$178.80	\$288.00
14	5	F011785 Gasket, Hydrant Base, 8-hole	\$11.25	\$9.50	\$7.50	\$32.95	\$17.50
15	6	G010050 Ford Ballcorp Corp Stop, 3/4", 3/4" AwWA Taper Thread x PJ Outlet, Ford #FB1000-3	\$245.22	\$259.80	\$258.00	\$355.50	\$273.00
16	6	G010090 Corp Stop, 3/4", CC-IP, Mueller #H-15025	\$144.12	\$163.50	\$157.50	\$340.50	\$171.00
17	6	G010100 Corp Stop, 1", CC-IP, Mueller #H-15025	\$220.20	\$249.60	\$240.00	\$451.92	\$262.50

18	10	G010190	\$583.30	\$618.00	\$537.50	\$463.50	\$650.00
		Valve, stop Angle Meter Ball, 3/4"					
		FIPT, Jones #J-1966W					
19	10	G010390	\$135.10	\$143.50	\$142.50	\$186.70	\$152.50
		Coupling, Qtr Bend, 3/4" CC-3/4"					
		FIPT, Mueller #H-15460, Jones #					
		J-1536 or Ford #L21-33					
20	10	G010400	\$211.00	\$268.00	\$440.00	\$390.50	\$287.50
		Coupling, Qtr Bend, 1" CC-1" CC,					
		Mueller #H-15525					
21	10	G010410	\$174.10	\$128.00	\$117.50	\$186.70	\$135.00
		Coupling, Qtr. Bend, 3/4" CC-3/4"					
		MIPT, Mueller #H-15530					
22	10	G010420	\$187.20	\$212.50	\$212.50	\$390.50	\$227.50
		Coupling, Qtr. Bend, 1" CC-1" MIPT,					
		Mueller #H-15530, Ford #L2844					
23	21	G010670	\$28.35	\$36.75	\$31.50	\$38.01	\$36.75
		Nipple, Brass, 3/4" x CLO					
24	7	G010750	\$28.70	\$42.00	\$31.50	\$39.97	\$35.00
		Nipple, Brass, 1" x 4"					
25	5	G010851	\$52.25	\$60.00	\$48.75	\$63.35	\$58.75
		Nipple, Brass, 1-1/2" x 5"					
26	15	G010901	\$205.35	\$270.00	\$225.00	\$292.05	\$270.00
		Nipple, Brass, 2" x 6"					
27	8	G011025	\$71.20	\$104.00	\$80.00	\$106.56	\$88.00
		Bushing, Brass, 2" x 1"					
28	120'	V010770	\$396.00	\$492.00	\$456.00	\$743.90	\$464.40
		Tubing, Copper, Type K, Annealed,					
		1", Must meet ASTMB-88 Standards,					
		60' Coils					
29	5	V011050	\$273.75	\$270.00	\$382.50	No Bid	\$260.00
		Hydrant Extension Spool, 6" Pipe, 6"					
		High, 6-8 Hole, Breakaway, Cement-					
		Lined					
30	12	No City Stock Number	\$154.20	\$178.20	\$177.00	\$271.20	\$189.00
		3/4" x 1" Coupling, MIPT/CTS PJ,					
		#C84-34					
31	12	No City Stock Number	\$300.36	\$318.60	\$318.00	\$484.20	\$336.00
		3/4" x 1" Coupling, MIPT/PVC PJ,					
		#C87-34					
32	12	No City Stock Number	\$13.56	\$15.60	\$16.20	No Bid	\$16.80
		3/4" Stainless Steel Inserts for 3/4"					
		CTS HDPE					
33	12	No City Stock Number	\$15.24	\$16.20	\$18.00	No Bid	\$18.00
		1" Stainless Steel Inserts for 1" CTS					
		HDPE					
34	12	No City Stock Number	\$161.76	\$183.00	\$183.00	\$257.40	\$198.00
		3/4" Female Flare Adapter to 3/4"					
		Pac Joint CTS, #C04--33					
35	12	No City Stock Number	\$237.72	\$269.40	\$270.00	\$284.88	\$288.00
		1" Female Flare Adapter to 1" Pac					
		Joint JTS, #C04-44					
36	12	No City Stock Number	\$14.76	\$30.00	\$24.00	No Bid	\$24.00
		6", 6-Hole, 150 lb., Full Face Gasket,					
		1/8" Red Rubber w/ 3/4" holes for					
		5/8 bolts					
		Subtotal	\$6,734.75	\$7,328.05	\$7,833.70	\$9,794.59	\$7,742.30
		California Sales Tax @ 7.75%	\$521.94	\$567.92	\$607.11	\$759.08	\$600.03
		Freight	Allowed	Allowed	Allowed	Allowed	Allowed
		Total	\$7,256.69	\$7,895.97	\$8,440.81	\$10,553.67	\$8,342.33