- Spreadsheet Evaluation for RFQ #2834
J Electrical Transformers

A (Price listed includes losses)
22 This information does not reflect the actual award of the bid -

o)

It is for recording purposes only. The winning bidder will be notified after evaluation of bid documents.

Item
#

Qty

Description

ABB c/o
Pacific Utilities

Anixter
(GE)

Anixter
(Cooper)

Wesco

CG Power
Systems

Ermco c/o Mcavoy
& Markham

Howard

Industries

One Source
(GE)

One Source
(Cooper)

One Source

(€M)

1

270-1025

$35,839.02

$29,841.72

$23,769.72

$24,312.61

No Bid

$19,108.74

$20,825.58

$22,564.02

$23,944.68

$19,222.98

25 kVA, Single Phase, Radial Feed, Padmount

Transformer

Primary Voltage: 12 kV Delta

Secondary Voltage: 240/120 Volt Delta

Per City of Lompoc Utility Department, Electric

Division Spec #ELE-115, R1, Dated 11/10/11

(4 kV conversion project)

270-2075

$8,415.75

$10,268.41

$13,821.85

$14,140.21

$11,691.36

$10,640.09

$13,242.36

$10,336.45

$13,925.53

$13,953.02

75 kVA, Three Phase, Radial Feed, Padmount

Transformer

Primary Voltage: 12 kV Delta

Secondary Voltage: 208/120 Volt Wye

Per City of Lompoc Utility Department Electric

Division Spec #ELE-115, R1, Dated 11/10/11

(4 kV conversion project)

270-2150

$29,192.54

$29,926.94

$35,283.20

$35,977.92

$31,967.64

$29,282.34

$34,233.30

$30,104.06

$35,510.00

$34,587.18

150 kVA, 3-Phase, Radial Feed, Padmount

Transformer

Primary Voltage: 12 kV Delta

Secondary Voltage: 208/120 Volt Wye

Per City of Lompoc Utility Dept. Electric Division

Spec #ELE-115, R1, Dated 11/10/11

(4 kV conversion project)

860-2300

$96,910.92

$97,633.04

$100,480.36

$102,122.48

$109,453.56

$95,746.76

$107,361.84

$98,190.32

$101,016.04

$95,585.68

300 kVA, 3-Phase, Radial Feed Padmount

Transformer

Primary Voltage: 4/12 kV Dual Voltage Delta

Secondary Voltage: 208/120 Volt Wye

Per City of Lompoc Utility Dept Electric Division

Spec #ELE-115, R1, Dated 11/10/11

470-1050

$16,788.08

$17,103.08

$15,961.36

$16,161.98

No Bid

$16,319.92

$16,263.84

$17,185.16

$16,028.32

$18,857.20

300 kVA, 3-Phase, Radial Feed, Padmount

Transformer

Primary Voltage: 4/12 kV Dual Voltage Delta

Secondary Voltage: 208/120 Volt Wye

Per City of Lompoc Utility Dept Electric Division

Spec #ELE-115, R1, Dated 11/10/11

(4 kV conversion project)




ABB c/o Pacific Utilities

1 6 270-1025
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal

N
w

6.34
4.31

3

(&)}
~

Total Amount Bid

2 1 270-2075
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
6.34
431

=
QB

Total Amount Bid

3 2 270-2150
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
348 6.34
845 4.31
Total Amount Bid

4 4 860-2300
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
709 6.34
1297 4.31

Total Amount Bid

©

5 4 470-1050
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
144 6.34
346 431
Total Amount Bid

2196
175.68
0

1287.02
2314.47

6776
542.08

507.2
590.47

8100
648

2206.32
3641.95

13095
1047.6

4495.06
5590.07

1660
132.8

912.96
1491.26

$13,176.00
$1,054.08
$0.00
$14,230.08
$7,722.12
$13,886.82
$35,839.02

$6,776.00
$542.08
$0.00
$7,318.08
$507.20
$590.47
$8,415.75

$16,200.00
$1,296.00
$0.00
$17,496.00
$4,412.64
$7,283.90
$29,192.54

$52,380.00
$4,190.40
$0.00
$56,570.40
$17,980.24
$22,360.28
$96,910.92

$6,640.00
$531.20
$0.00
$7,171.20
$3,651.84
$5,965.04
$16,788.08



Anixter (GE)

1 6 270-1025
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
71 6.34

183 431
Total Amount Bid
Total Amount Bid

2 1 270-2075
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
233 6.34
541 4.31
Total Amount Bid

3 2 270-2150
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
379 6.34
951 4.31
Total Amount Bid

4 4 860-2300
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
714 6.34
1534 431
Total Amount Bid

5 4 470-1050
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
110 6.34
399 431
Total Amount Bid

2311
184.88

450.14
788.73

5981
478.48

1477.22
2331.71

7835
626.8

2402.86
4098.81

12287
982.96

4526.76
6611.54

1721
137.68

697.4
1719.69

$13,866.00
$1,109.28
$0.00
$14,975.28
$2,700.84
$4,732.38
$22,408.50
$29,841.72

$5,981.00
$478.48
$0.00
$6,459.48
$1,477.22
$2,331.71
$10,268.41

$15,670.00
$1,253.60
$0.00
$16,923.60
$4,805.72
$8,197.62
$29,926.94

$49,148.00
$3,931.84
$0.00
$53,079.84
$18,107.04
$26,446.16
$97,633.04

$6,884.00
$550.72
$0.00
$7,434.72
$2,789.60
$6,878.76
$17,103.08



Anixter (Cooper)

1 6 270-1025
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
80 6.34
158 431
Total Amount Bid

2 1 270-2075
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal

N
[N

1 6.34

4.31

(o2}
©

Total Amount Bid

3 2 270-2150
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
348 6.34
1088 431
Total Amount Bid

4 4 860-2300
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
595 6.34
2001 431
Total Amount Bid

5 4 470-1050
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
129 6.34
380 431
Total Amount Bid

2568
205.44

507.2
680.98

9129
730.32
0

1337.74
2624.79

9950
796

2206.32
4689.28

11781
942.48

3772.3
8624.31

1421
113.68

817.86
1637.8

$15,408.00
$1,232.64
$0.00
$16,640.64
$3,043.20
$4,085.88
$23,769.72

$9,129.00
$730.32
$0.00
$9,859.32
$1,337.74
$2,624.79
$13,821.85

$19,900.00
$1,592.00
$0.00
$21,492.00
$4,412.64
$9,378.56
$35,283.20

$47,124.00
$3,769.92
$0.00
$50,893.92
$15,089.20
$34,497.24
$100,480.36

$5,684.00
$454.72
$0.00
$6,138.72
$3,271.44
$6,551.20
$15,961.36



Wesco

6 270-1025
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
80 6.34
158 431
Total Amount Bid
1 270-2075
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
211 6.34
609 431
Total Amount Bid
2 270-2150
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
348 6.34
1088 431
Total Amount Bid
4 860-2300
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
595 6.34
2001 431
Total Amount Bid
4 470-1050
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
129 6.34
380 431

Total Amount Bid

2651.78
212.1424
0

507.2
680.98

9423.78
753.9024
0

1337.74
2624.79

10271.63
821.7304

2206.32
4689.28

12161.12
972.8896

3772.3
8624.31

1467.44
117.3952

817.86
1637.8

$15,910.68
$1,272.85
$0.00
$17,183.53
$3,043.20
$4,085.88
$24,312.61

$9,423.78
$753.90
$0.00
$10,177.68
$1,337.74
$2,624.79
$14,140.21

$20,543.26
$1,643.46
$0.00
$22,186.72
$4,412.64
$9,378.56
$35,977.92

$48,644.48
$3,891.56
$0.00
$52,536.04
$15,089.20
$34,497.24
$102,122.48

$5,869.76
$469.58
$0.00
$6,339.34
$3,271.44
$6,551.20
$16,161.98



CG Power Systems

1 6 270-1025
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
_ 6.34
_ 431
Total Amount Bid
2 1 270-2075
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
215 6.34
654 431
Total Amount Bid
3 2 270-2150
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
359 6.34
1148 431
Total Amount Bid
4 4 860-2300
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
604 6.34
1977 431
Total Amount Bid
5 4 470-1050
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
6.34
431

Total Amount Bid

6569
525.52
415

1363.1
2818.74

7636
610.88
513

2276.06
4947.88

13202
1056.16
755

3829.36
8520.87

No Bid

No Bid

$6,569.00
$525.52
$415.00
$7,509.52
$1,363.10
$2,818.74
$11,691.36

$15,272.00
$1,221.76
$1,026.00
$17,519.76
$4,552.12
$9,895.76
$31,967.64

$52,808.00
$4,224.64
$3,020.00
$60,052.64
$15,317.44
$34,083.48
$109,453.56

No Bid

No Bid



McAvoy & Markham

1 6 270-1025
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
73
179

Total Amount Bid

© [w

2 1 270-2075
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
216
547
Total Amount Bid

(2]

3 2 270-2150
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal

w
[e2]
»

(00
(€3}
a1

Total Amount Bid

4 4 860-2300
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
472
1859
Total Amount Bid

5 4 470-1050
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
133
324
Total Amount Bid

6.34
4.31

6.34
4.31

6.34
4.31

6.34
4.31

6.34
4.31

1806
144.48

462.82
771.49

6401
512.08
0

1369.44
2357.57

7996
639.68

2320.44
3685.05

11974
957.92

2992.48
8012.29

1704
136.32

843.22
1396.44

$10,836.00
$866.88
$0.00
$11,702.88
$2,776.92
$4,628.94
$19,108.74

$6,401.00
$512.08
$0.00
$6,913.08
$1,369.44
$2,357.57
$10,640.09

$15,992.00
$1,279.36
$0.00
$17,271.36
$4,640.88
$7,370.10
$29,282.34

$47,896.00
$3,831.68
$0.00
$51,727.68
$11,969.92
$32,049.16
$95,746.76

$6,816.00
$545.28
$0.00
$7,361.28
$3,372.88
$5,585.76
$16,319.92



Howard Industries

1

6 270-1025
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
88
163
Total Amount Bid

1 270-2075
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
205
672
Total Amount Bid

2 270-2150
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
364
999
Total Amount Bid

4 860-2300
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
710
1554
Total Amount Bid

4 470-1050
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
134
352
Total Amount Bid

6.34
4.31

6.34
4.31

6.34
4.31

6.34
4.31

6.34
4.31

1956
156.48
98

557.92
702.53

8017
641.36
388

1299.7
2896.32

9315
745.2
443

2307.76
4305.69

14004
1120.32
517

4501.4
6697.74

1516
121.28
62

849.56
1517.12

$11,736.00
$938.88
$588.00
$13,262.88
$3,347.52
$4,215.18
$20,825.58

$8,017.00
$641.36
$388.00
$9,046.36
$1,299.70
$2,896.32
$13,242.38

$18,630.00
$1,490.40
$886.00
$21,006.40
$4,615.52
$8,611.38
$34,233.30

$56,016.00
$4,481.28
$2,068.00
$62,565.28
$18,005.60
$26,790.96
$107,361.84

$6,064.00
$485.12
$248.00
$6,797.12
$3,398.24
$6,068.48
$16,263.84



One Source (Cooper)

1 6 270-1025
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
80 6.34
158 431
Total Amount Bid

2 1 270-2075
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal

N
[N

1 6.34

4.31

(o2}
©

Total Amount Bid

3 2 270-2150
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
348 6.34
1088 431
Total Amount Bid

4 4 860-2300
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
595 6.34
2001 431
Total Amount Bid

5 4 470-1050
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
129 6.34
380 431
Total Amount Bid

2595
207.6

507.2
680.98

9225
738
0

1337.74
2624.79

10055
804.4

2206.32
4689.28

11905
952.4

3772.3
8624.31

1436.5
114.92

817.86
1637.8

$15,570.00
$1,245.60
$0.00
$16,815.60
$3,043.20
$4,085.88
$23,944.68

$9,225.00
$738.00
$0.00
$9,963.00
$1,337.74
$2,624.79
$13,925.53

$20,110.00
$1,608.80
$0.00
$21,718.80
$4,412.64
$9,378.56
$35,510.00

$47,620.00
$3,809.60
$0.00
$51,429.60
$15,089.20
$34,497.24
$101,016.04

$5,746.00
$459.68
$0.00
$6,205.68
$3,271.44
$6,551.20
$16,028.32



One Source (GE)

1

6 270-1025
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
71
183
Total Amount Bid

1 270-2075
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
233
541
Total Amount Bid

2 270-2150
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
379
951
Total Amount Bid

4 860-2300
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
714
1534
Total Amount Bid

4 470-1050
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
110
399
Total Amount Bid

6.34
4.31

6.34
4.31

6.34
4.31

6.34
4.31

6.34
4.31

2335.1
186.808
0

450.14
788.73

6044
483.52
0

1477.22
2331.71

7917
633.36

2402.86
4098.81

12416
993.28

4526.76
6611.54

1740
139.2

697.4
1719.69

$14,010.60
$1,120.85
$0.00
$15,131.45
$2,700.84
$4,732.38
$22,564.67

$6,044.00
$483.52
$0.00
$6,527.52
$1,477.22
$2,331.71
$10,336.45

$15,834.00
$1,266.72
$0.00
$17,100.72
$4,805.72
$8,197.62
$30,104.06

$49,664.00
$3,973.12
$0.00
$53,637.12
$18,107.04
$26,446.16
$98,190.32

$6,960.00
$556.80
$0.00
$7,516.80
$2,789.60
$6,878.76
$17,185.16



One Source (Central Moloney)

1 6 270-1025
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
8

=
w N

Total Amount Bid

2 1 270-2075
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
18

5

©

»
N

Total Amount Bid

3 2 270-2150
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal

w
o

1

[N
[N
o
a1

Total Amount Bid

4 4 860-2300
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
537
1844
Total Amount Bid

5 4 470-1050
California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
Freight
Subtotal
135
368
Total Amount Bid

6.34
4.31

6.34
4.31

6.34
4.31

6.34
4.31

6.34
4.31

1794.74
143.5792
0

519.88
745.63

9208
736.64
0

1198.26
2810.12

9783
782.64

1965.4
4762.55

11615
929.2

3404.58
7947.64

2104
168.32

855.9
1586.08

$10,768.44
$861.48
$0.00
$11,629.92
$3,119.28
$4,473.78
$19,222.98

$9,208.00
$736.64
$0.00
$9,944.64
$1,198.26
$2,810.12
$13,953.02

$19,566.00
$1,565.28
$0.00
$21,131.28
$3,930.80
$9,525.10
$34,587.18

$46,460.00
$3,716.80
$0.00
$50,176.80
$13,618.32
$31,790.56
$95,585.68

$8,416.00
$673.28
$0.00
$9,089.28
$3,423.60
$6,344.32
$18,857.20
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The following features in this workbook are not supported by
earlier versions of Excel. These features may be lost or
degraded when you save this workbook in an earlier file
format.

Minor loss of fidelity # of
occurrences
Some cells or styles in this workbook contain formatting that 2

is not supported by the selected file format. These formats will
be converted to the closest format available.






