Spreadsheet Evaluation Bid #2821

Miscellaneous Electric Supplies

One California
Description Anixter Source Electric Wesco
1| 100{115-9029 $381.00 $357.00 No Bid $270.00
Insulator, Guy Strain, 5-1/2", 20K Ib, Victor #506
Joslyn #L506, Chance C909-1043
2| 100{115-9071 $1,756.00 $1,918.00 No Bid $1,820.00
Deadend Feed-Thru, 3/8" Guy Wire, Long, Reliable
#5202L
3| 200]117-0112 $210.00 $224.00 No Bid $206.00
Bolt, Machine, 5/8" x 12", Hot Dipped Galvanized,
MCED #DF3B12, Chance #8812, Joslyn #8812,
with nut
4| 100]117-1350 $500.00 $503.00 No Bid $415.00
Service Knobe Nylon Wire, Joslyn #J0588HG-Z,
MCED #DW2C5, 25/cs
5| 200{117-1403 $146.00 $138.20 $136.00 $144.40
Connector, Split Bolt, 12-10 Str., CU to CU Connec-
tion (Wire:12 STR-10 STR) PU S-10, Burndy KS-90)
6| 100{117-1507 $41.00 $35.10 $36.00 $36.70
Connector, Insulink, 2-4 Str, PU #PI1K-12, Burndy
H#ES2R2W
7| 100{117-2702 $136.00 $126.30 $120.00 $138.00
Clamp, Ground Rod, 5/8", #8-1/0 CU, Blackburn
#JAB58H
8| 100]|117-2722 $378.00 $360.00 $367.00 $391.00
Sleeve, Full Tension, 1/0 CU, Burndy #YDS25
9| 150]118-5080 $2,410.50 $2,325.00 No Bid $2,506.50
Insulator, 35 kV, Tie-Top, Polyethylene, Hendrix/
HPI-35<*MUST CHOOSE BETWEEN 1" or 1-3/8"
PIN UPON ORDER*
10| 200[122-0520 $60.00 $58.68 $58.00 No Bid
Conduit, 3/4", PVC Sch 80 (10' Lengths)
11| 150[122-0540 $52.86 $60.90 $52.50 $67.80
Conduit, 1", PVC Sch 80 (10' Lengths)
12| 10[122-0648 $524.50 No Bid $185.50 No Bid
Elbow, 3", 90 Degree, Sch 80, 16"R, Carlon
#UB9HL
13| 15(122-0682 $43.05 $22.49 $21.90 $22.02
Coupling, 4", PVC, Sch 40, Carlon #E940N
14| 12|122-2211 $40.32 $18.00 $120.00 No Bid
Coupling, 3", P&C, Long, Carlon #E241L
15| 20[122-2284 $87.00 $52.43 $50.80 $52.76
End Bell, 4", PVC Conduit, Carlon #E997N
16| 30{124-5005 $320.70 $338.10 $658.50 $567.50
Bus, Secondary Terminal, 5-Position, 1 Set Screw, (Must order 36)
Utilco #PED5-350SS- No Subs!
17| 15|124-5033 $445.35 $480.15 No Bid $450.00

Bus, Secondary Terminal, 4-Position, 2 Set Screw,

Utilco #PED4-750SS- No Subs!




18| 50[124-6310 $2,832.50 $1,156.50 No Bid $3,050.00
Elbow, Loadbreak, 4 Str., 15 kV, for .630 Insulation (Elastimold)
Diameter, 8.3/14.4 kV Class 200 Amp, RTE $1,376.00
#2604600B20MA or Cooper #LE215CCA02T (Cooper)

19| 160{124-6320 $3,777.60 $3,700.80 No Bid $3,643.20
Elbow, Loadbreak, #2 Str, 15 kV for .780 Insulation (Elastimold)
Diameter, 8.3/14.4 kV Class 200 Amp, Elastimold $4,403.20
#166LRB5220, RTE #2604600B45MA or Cooper (Cooper)
#LE215B04T

20| 150]124-6350 $3,541.50 $3,469.50 No Bid $3,579.00
Elbow, Loadbreak, 2/0, Str., 15 kV for .910 (Elastimold)
Insulation Diameter, 8.3/14.4 kV Class 200 Amp, $4,128.00
Elastimold #166LR-GAB-250 or Cooper LE215CO7T (Cooper)

21| 30|124-6488 $4,824.00 $4,530.00 No Bid $3,901.50
Bus, 3-Way, 200 Amp, with Bracket, Cooper (Elastimold)
#1.J215C3B (Cooper>) $4,893.00

22| 15|124-6489 $2,610.00 $2,558.70 No Bid $2,775.00
Bus, 4-Way, 200 Amp, 15 kV, with U-Straps and (Elastimold)
Bracket, Cooper #LJ215C4B- No Subs! (Cooper>) $2,715.90

23| 30|124-6499 $945.30 $1,008.30 No Bid $897.00
Standoff, 200 Amp, 15 kV, RTE #2625063B01M,
Elastimold #166LR-GAB-250 or Cooper LE215CO7T

24| 50|124-6807 $980.50 $999.50 No Bid $1,021.50
Cap, Insulated, 200 Amp, with Drain Wire, Elasti-
mold #160-DRG

25| 15]124-9517 $2,932.50 No Bid $4,120.00 No Bid
Drop-in Anchor, Ramset Redhead, 1/2", Stainless
Steel Only, Part #SSRM-12

26| 60]124-9601 $84.60 $80.40 $79.80 $85.20
Lug, CU Comp. Term., #2 Str, Stud: 3/8", 1-Hole,
Burndy #YA2C-L4-BOX - No Subs!

27| 30|124-9604 $33.60 $32.70 $31.50 $26.79
Lug, CU Comp., Term, #4 Str, Stud Size: 3/8" (Must order 50)
1-Hole, Burndy #YAAC-L4-BOX - No Subs!

28| 10|124-9654 $474.70 $464.60 $695.40 $485.30

Connector, 4-Cable, 4-Hole, 350-800-AL-CU,

Homac #A54A4-800N

California Sales Tax @ 8.0%
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