
Spreadsheet Evaluation 
Miscellaneous Water Products
RFQ #2820  
Disclaimer: This information does not reflect actual awarding of the BID. It is for recording purposes only.
The winning bidder will be notified.  

Line Ferguson Famcon HD Supply
Item Qty Description Enterprises Corix Pipe & Supply Waterworks

1 2 AD10090 $111.72 $107.00 $114.00 $116.00
Clamp, Full Circle Repair, 4-5", 4.95 - 5.35, Single
Band w/ low alloy nuts & bolts, Rockwell #226-

 050007-000, Ford #FS1-535x7.5
2 1 AD10095 $141.80 $135.82 $143.00 $136.00

Ford Meter Box Tapped Repair Clamp, FWI-535-15-
 IP7 (OD Range 4.95 - 5.35), 4" ACP w. 2" ICP Tap,

15" long
3 4 B010810 $291.52 $208.00 $288.00 $199.00

Adapter, Mega-Flange, 3" for all Pipe. Complete with
 gasket, bolts & nuts, EBBA Series 2100P/N 2103E

4 4 B010850 $14.20 $12.88 $16.00 $12.60
Gasket, Trans, MJ x IPS, 3" (3.50 OD) for mega-

 flange adapter, EBAA Series 2100
5 5 B011400 $142.58 $69.95 $120.00 $60.00

Flange, Cast Iron, 3" x 7-1/2" Wide, w/ 2" Tap, 4-
Hole, Flanges shall be 125/150 lbs., conform to
ANSI/AWWA C-110/A21.10

6 3 C012120 $119.84 $203.91 $109.05 $111.75
Saddle, Service, 4" AC x 3/4" CS Tap, 4.80-5.45 OD
Range (Jones #J1975) 4.74 - 5.32 OD Range 
(Mueller #H-16080), Single Strap

7 20 C013585 $373.64 $400.00 $330.00 $360.00
Bolt Kit for 6-8" Flanges, Hex Head, 3/4" x 3-1/4"
With Nut, 8 Bolts/Nuts per kit, Grade 5 Steel, Tripac
Blue 2000 or T-2000 Blue Only

8 3 C016130 $330.73 $301.71 $292.50 $299.25
Saddle, Service, 4" AC x 3/4" CS Tap, 4.80-5.45 OD
Range (Jones #J979), 6.84-7.45 OD Range (Mueller
#H-16105), Double Strap

9 10 D011740 $1,652.64 $1,550.40 $1,580.00 $1,562.50
C'Setter, Meter, 3/4", 12" Height, Horizontal Inlet
& Outlet, Ford #VBHC73-12W-11-33, Cambridge
Brass #6020NL-312D3D3-VQN

10 24 F011345 $296.71 $278.40 $270.00 $282.00
Coupling, Straight, 3/4" MIPT x 3/4" GJ for CTS
Ford #C84-33G, Std Pkg of 24/ea

11 5 F011530 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Valve, Rubber, 4" for Clow/Rich 550 Hydrant
P/N T1630524

12 5 F011540 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Washer Only, Valve, 4", Clow 500W Series
(Model A-550), Hydrant Part #7

13 5 G010060 $262.25 $246.00 $238.75 $247.50
Ford Ballcorp Corporation Stop, 1x1" Taper Thread



Inlet x PJ Outlet, Ford #FB1000-4
14 25 G010730 $61.55 $49.00 $77.50 $50.00

Nipple, Brass, 1" x CLO (2")
15 10 G010731 $36.04 $30.40 $36.00 $30.00

Nipple, Brass, 1" x 2-1/2"
16 5 G010890 $31.81 $57.40 $67.50 $53.75

Nipple, Brass, 2" x 4-1/2"
17 6 G011020 $69.56 $63.72 $81.00 $52.50

Bushing, Brass, 2" x 3/4"
18 5 G011035 $42.64 $44.20 $55.50 $37.50

Bushing, Brass, 2" x 1-1/2"
19 5 G011040 $136.10 $130.00 $206.00 $111.25

Bushing, Brass, 2" x 3"
20 3 V011010 No Bid $273.00 $256.50 $363.00

Hydrant Extension Spool, 6" Pipe, 18" High
4-4 Hole, Breakaway, Cement-Lined

21 1 VS30145 $208.79 $205.00 $200.00 $191.50
Hydrant Bury, 6" x 3", Flg x Flg, Cement-Lined,
AWWA G104/A21.4-90/AWWA C-110, Part #
CWBR4FLG6X30

22 2 VS30165 $439.56 $472.00 $410.00 $393.50
Hydrant Bury, 6" x 42", Flg x Flg, Cement-Lined,
AWWA G104/A21.4-90/AWWA110

Total $4,763.68 $4,838.79 $4,891.30 $4,669.60
Sales Tax @ 8.0% $381.09 $387.10 $391.30 $373.57
Total $5,144.77 $5,225.89 $5,282.60 $5,043.17
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